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The GNU/Linux® success story is well known. Firmly established as a high-performance operating system,
its worldwide installations are increasing at phenomenal rates. Much of this success has been on the server
side, but more and more PC users are turning to Linux on the desktop, as well.For those grounded in
Microsoft Windows® or Apple Macintosh® graphical interfaces, the first look at a powerful Unix-style
operating system can be daunting. This book provides a clear, no-nonsense introduction to the popular Red
Hat® distribution of Linux. It takes you through installation and shows you the key parts of the system,
always with an eye toward what can go wrong and what you need to know to get over the humps.Linux is
known as a secure environment and a good platform to run a web server. These topics are among the many
covered in this book. But did you know you can also burn CDs, sync a PalmPilot™, and edit slideshow
presentations with powerful tools on Linux? Those topics are covered here, too.Red Hat currently provides
two distributions, both documented in this book. The first is their commercial, subscription-based product,
called Red Hat Enterprise Linux and also available through retail channels as Red Hat Professional
Workstation. The second is the freely distributed Fedora distribution. The Publisher's Edition of Fedora is
included in this book on two disks.New in this edition are installation instructions for Red Hat Enterprise
Linux and Fedora, package updating for Red Hat Enterprise Linux and Fedora, information on the GRUB
bootloader, and the CUPS printer system.Learning Red Hat Enterprise Linux and Fedora tells you how to:

Prepare your system for installing Linux●

Install and configure Linux and the two popular desktop environments, GNOME and KDE.●

Run the most popular productivity tools on Linux: mailers, web browsers, OpenOffice, and Evolution.●

Obtain and set up software through the Red Hat Package Manager (RPM)●

Set up a Linux system for networking, either on your local area network (LAN), or via a dialup connection●

to the Internet.
Use the system-administration tools included with Red Hat, GNOME, and KDE, including such valuable●

utilities as Samba file-sharing and the Apache web server.
Understand and write shell scripts so you can peek under the hood and extend the power of Linux.●
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From reader reviews:

Tanya Minor:

Do you have favorite book? If you have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important thing for
us to learn everything in the world. Each book has different aim or maybe goal; it means that publication has
different type. Some people truly feel enjoy to spend their the perfect time to read a book. They are reading
whatever they have because their hobby is usually reading a book. What about the person who don't like
studying a book? Sometime, individual feel need book once they found difficult problem or maybe exercise.
Well, probably you will need this Learning Red Hat Enterprise Linux and Fedora.

David Gaytan:

Do you have something that you like such as book? The book lovers usually prefer to select book like comic,
quick story and the biggest an example may be novel. Now, why not attempting Learning Red Hat Enterprise
Linux and Fedora that give your satisfaction preference will be satisfied simply by reading this book.
Reading routine all over the world can be said as the opportunity for people to know world much better then
how they react to the world. It can't be explained constantly that reading habit only for the geeky man or
woman but for all of you who wants to be success person. So , for every you who want to start studying as
your good habit, you could pick Learning Red Hat Enterprise Linux and Fedora become your starter.

Phil Garcia:

Reading a book to become new life style in this yr; every people loves to go through a book. When you read
a book you can get a wide range of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your knowledge,
since book has a lot of information upon it. The information that you will get depend on what types of book
that you have read. If you would like get information about your analysis, you can read education books, but
if you act like you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics, and also
soon. The Learning Red Hat Enterprise Linux and Fedora will give you new experience in reading a book.

Diane Wilson:

As a pupil exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher inquired them to go to the library in order to
make summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just very little students that has reading's soul or real
their interest. They just do what the professor want, like asked to go to the library. They go to presently there
but nothing reading very seriously. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring and also can't see
colorful images on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important for you personally. As we
know that on this time, many ways to get whatever we really wish for. Likewise word says, many ways to
reach Chinese's country. Therefore this Learning Red Hat Enterprise Linux and Fedora can make you really
feel more interested to read.
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