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• Is the geometry of the New Jerusalem, the Holy of Holies, and the Tefillin - a paradigm for the geometry of
the universe? Is our universe a cube within a larger cube? • Will the expansion of the observable universe
come to a dramatic end in our lifetime - as depicted in illustrations 8-10 of this book? Was this event foretold
in the Book of Revelation? • Will the timing of this event coincide with the Maya prophecy of 2012, or Isaac
Newton's prediction for the return of Christ in 2060?
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From reader reviews:

George Cardenas:

The feeling that you get from 2012 The Great Event could be the more deep you searching the information
that hide in the words the more you get thinking about reading it. It does not mean that this book is hard to
understand but 2012 The Great Event giving you thrill feeling of reading. The author conveys their point in
selected way that can be understood simply by anyone who read this because the author of this publication is
well-known enough. That book also makes your own vocabulary increase well. Therefore it is easy to
understand then can go to you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We highly recommend you for
having this kind of 2012 The Great Event instantly.

Paul Douglas:

Reading a e-book can be one of a lot of activity that everyone in the world enjoys. Do you like reading book
consequently. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoy it. First reading a e-book will give you a lot of
new facts. When you read a e-book you will get new information because book is one of various ways to
share the information or maybe their idea. Second, studying a book will make you actually more imaginative.
When you examining a book especially fictional book the author will bring that you imagine the story how
the people do it anything. Third, you may share your knowledge to other individuals. When you read this
2012 The Great Event, it is possible to tells your family, friends and soon about yours reserve. Your
knowledge can inspire different ones, make them reading a reserve.

Gary Spengler:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to do! A lot of people spent their down time with their family, or their
particular friends. Usually they performing activity like watching television, about to beach, or picnic inside
park. They actually doing same task every week. Do you feel it? Would you like to something different to fill
your free time/ holiday? Can be reading a book can be option to fill your cost-free time/ holiday. The first
thing that you ask may be what kinds of publication that you should read. If you want to consider look for
book, may be the publication untitled 2012 The Great Event can be fine book to read. May be it is usually
best activity to you.

Dennis Mock:

Reading a book to get new life style in this 12 months; every people loves to examine a book. When you
examine a book you can get a lots of benefit. When you read books, you can improve your knowledge, since
book has a lot of information on it. The information that you will get depend on what types of book that you
have read. If you would like get information about your analysis, you can read education books, but if you
act like you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, such us novel, comics, as well as soon. The
2012 The Great Event provide you with a new experience in examining a book.
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