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A survival guide companion for students beginning their first online or hybrid class

Introduction to Online Learning introduces first-time distance learners to the realities of Web-based
education and serves as the most comprehensive, practical guide to achieving success when facing online-
specific barriers as well as common academic hurdles. Written by an experienced instructor, this invaluable
aid shows students how to overcome challenges related to e-mail communication, technological catastrophes,
staying organized on a daily basis, and more. Students learn to take advantage of the unique resources
available for those enrolled in internet-based programs and to make the most of their Web-based educational
experience by tailoring it to their personal strengths, needs, and learning styles.

Key Features

The author provides clear explanations of how to tailor research, writing, and citing sources to the online●

classroom, as well as when citations are necessary
Concrete, original examples link the text to students' personal experiences; illustrations vividly bring●

material to life
Screenshots and excerpts from online syllabi help students navigate their first course requirements●

Examples of appropriate discussion board interaction aid students in progressing in their course with●

confidence
Self-assessments guide students in determining individual learning styles and levels of preparedness●
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From reader reviews:

Brad Black:

Book will be written, printed, or descriptive for everything. You can recognize everything you want by a e-
book. Book has a different type. As we know that book is important matter to bring us around the world.
Alongside that you can your reading ability was fluently. A reserve Introduction to Online Learning: A
Guide for Students will make you to possibly be smarter. You can feel far more confidence if you can know
about every little thing. But some of you think which open or reading the book make you bored. It is not
necessarily make you fun. Why they may be thought like that? Have you searching for best book or suitable
book with you?

Anthony Harrison:

Hey guys, do you really wants to finds a new book to see? May be the book with the subject Introduction to
Online Learning: A Guide for Students suitable to you? The actual book was written by popular writer in this
era. Often the book untitled Introduction to Online Learning: A Guide for Studentsis a single of several
books which everyone read now. This book was inspired many people in the world. When you read this
publication you will enter the new dimension that you ever know ahead of. The author explained their
strategy in the simple way, thus all of people can easily to know the core of this book. This book will give
you a lot of information about this world now. So that you can see the represented of the world in this
particular book.

Corey Valenzuela:

The e-book untitled Introduction to Online Learning: A Guide for Students is the reserve that recommended
to you you just read. You can see the quality of the book content that will be shown to anyone. The language
that article author use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The article author was did a lot of
study when write the book, therefore the information that they share for you is absolutely accurate. You also
will get the e-book of Introduction to Online Learning: A Guide for Students from the publisher to make you
more enjoy free time.

Jeffrey Paolucci:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that question when you got students? We believe that that concern was
given by teacher to the students. Many kinds of hobby, Every person has different hobby. And you also
know that little person like reading or as studying become their hobby. You should know that reading is very
important along with book as to be the factor. Book is important thing to increase you knowledge, except
your own teacher or lecturer. You get good news or update regarding something by book. A substantial
number of sorts of books that can you go onto be your object. One of them are these claims Introduction to
Online Learning: A Guide for Students.
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