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Some probability problems are so difficult that they stump the smartest mathematicians. But even the hardest
of these problems can often be solved with a computer and a Monte Carlo simulation, in which a random-
number generator simulates a physical process, such as a million rolls of a pair of dice. This is what Digital
Dice is all about: how to get numerical answers to difficult probability problems without having to solve
complicated mathematical equations.

Popular-math writer Paul Nahin challenges readers to solve twenty-one difficult but fun problems, from
determining the odds of coin-flipping games to figuring out the behavior of elevators. Problems build from
relatively easy (deciding whether a dishwasher who breaks most of the dishes at a restaurant during a given
week is clumsy or just the victim of randomness) to the very difficult (tackling branching processes of the
kind that had to be solved by Manhattan Project mathematician Stanislaw Ulam). In his characteristic style,
Nahin brings the problems to life with interesting and odd historical anecdotes. Readers learn, for example,
not just how to determine the optimal stopping point in any selection process but that astronomer Johannes
Kepler selected his second wife by interviewing eleven women.

The book shows readers how to write elementary computer codes using any common programming
language, and provides solutions and line-by-line walk-throughs of a MATLAB code for each problem.

Digital Dice will appeal to anyone who enjoys popular math or computer science. In a new preface, Nahin
wittily addresses some of the responses he received to the first edition.
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From reader reviews:

Douglas Leverette:

Do you have favorite book? In case you have, what is your favorite's book? Guide is very important thing for
us to find out everything in the world. Each reserve has different aim as well as goal; it means that guide has
different type. Some people feel enjoy to spend their the perfect time to read a book. They are really reading
whatever they acquire because their hobby is reading a book. Why not the person who don't like reading
through a book? Sometime, man or woman feel need book once they found difficult problem or exercise.
Well, probably you should have this Digital Dice: Computational Solutions to Practical Probability Problems
(Princeton Puzzlers).

Krystal Wilson:

This Digital Dice: Computational Solutions to Practical Probability Problems (Princeton Puzzlers) book is
just not ordinary book, you have after that it the world is in your hands. The benefit you receive by reading
this book is actually information inside this book incredible fresh, you will get facts which is getting deeper
anyone read a lot of information you will get. This Digital Dice: Computational Solutions to Practical
Probability Problems (Princeton Puzzlers) without we understand teach the one who looking at it become
critical in pondering and analyzing. Don't be worry Digital Dice: Computational Solutions to Practical
Probability Problems (Princeton Puzzlers) can bring whenever you are and not make your handbag space or
bookshelves' turn into full because you can have it within your lovely laptop even phone. This Digital Dice:
Computational Solutions to Practical Probability Problems (Princeton Puzzlers) having fine arrangement in
word and also layout, so you will not truly feel uninterested in reading.

Jon Pittenger:

Nowadays reading books be a little more than want or need but also become a life style. This reading habit
give you lot of advantages. The benefits you got of course the knowledge the particular information inside
the book that improve your knowledge and information. The information you get based on what kind of
publication you read, if you want have more knowledge just go with schooling books but if you want truly
feel happy read one together with theme for entertaining like comic or novel. Typically the Digital Dice:
Computational Solutions to Practical Probability Problems (Princeton Puzzlers) is kind of e-book which is
giving the reader unpredictable experience.

Norma Ochoa:

This Digital Dice: Computational Solutions to Practical Probability Problems (Princeton Puzzlers) is brand
new way for you who has attention to look for some information since it relief your hunger details. Getting
deeper you upon it getting knowledge more you know otherwise you who still having bit of digest in reading
this Digital Dice: Computational Solutions to Practical Probability Problems (Princeton Puzzlers) can be the
light food for you personally because the information inside that book is easy to get by means of anyone.



These books create itself in the form which can be reachable by anyone, that's why I mean in the e-book
type. People who think that in e-book form make them feel tired even dizzy this book is the answer. So you
cannot find any in reading a publication especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It should
be here for you. So , don't miss it! Just read this e-book sort for your better life and also knowledge.
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