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In the Grip of Strange Thoughts: Russian Poetry in a New Era is a Russian and English bilingual edition of
thirty-two contemporary poets writing amidst the upheaval of the Russian 1990s. The collection conveys a
sense of the profound freedom and energy of a unique moment in Russian history, as well as the diversity of
experience in the years before and since. Edited by poet and translator J. Kates and with a foreword by poet
Mikhail Aizenberg, the collection includes poems written long before 1990 but which could not be
published, and those of more recent vintage. These thirty-two poets represent a phenomenal range of styles
and perspectives. Beginning with the poet and popular songwriter Bulat Okudzhava, who started
accompanying his poems on his guitar in the 1950s, the anthology includes poets whose work is deeply
rooted in established conventions, avant gardists experimenting with new forms, and adherents of Russian
free verse.
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From reader reviews:

Sandra Spier:

Have you spare time for just a day? What do you do when you have much more or little spare time? Sure,
you can choose the suitable activity with regard to spend your time. Any person spent their own spare time to
take a walk, shopping, or went to often the Mall. How about open as well as read a book entitled In The Grip
of Strange Thoughts: Russian Poetry in a New Era (Of Judaism; 153) (Russian Edition)? Maybe it is for
being best activity for you. You already know beside you can spend your time with the favorite's book, you
can cleverer than before. Do you agree with its opinion or you have various other opinion?

George McDaniel:

Do you one among people who can't read enjoyable if the sentence chained in the straightway, hold on guys
this kind of aren't like that. This In The Grip of Strange Thoughts: Russian Poetry in a New Era (Of Judaism;
153) (Russian Edition) book is readable through you who hate the straight word style. You will find the info
here are arrange for enjoyable reading through experience without leaving actually decrease the knowledge
that want to deliver to you. The writer associated with In The Grip of Strange Thoughts: Russian Poetry in a
New Era (Of Judaism; 153) (Russian Edition) content conveys objective easily to understand by most
people. The printed and e-book are not different in the articles but it just different as it. So , do you
nevertheless thinking In The Grip of Strange Thoughts: Russian Poetry in a New Era (Of Judaism; 153)
(Russian Edition) is not loveable to be your top list reading book?

Clyde Miller:

Reading a guide can be one of a lot of task that everyone in the world adores. Do you like reading book so.
There are a lot of reasons why people like it. First reading a book will give you a lot of new info. When you
read a e-book you will get new information since book is one of many ways to share the information or even
their idea. Second, studying a book will make an individual more imaginative. When you reading a book
especially fiction book the author will bring one to imagine the story how the characters do it anything.
Third, it is possible to share your knowledge to other individuals. When you read this In The Grip of Strange
Thoughts: Russian Poetry in a New Era (Of Judaism; 153) (Russian Edition), it is possible to tells your
family, friends along with soon about yours book. Your knowledge can inspire average, make them reading a
e-book.

John Martindale:

People live in this new day of lifestyle always aim to and must have the extra time or they will get lots of
stress from both daily life and work. So , when we ask do people have extra time, we will say absolutely yes.
People is human not only a robot. Then we request again, what kind of activity are you experiencing when
the spare time coming to you actually of course your answer will probably unlimited right. Then do you try
this one, reading ebooks. It can be your alternative in spending your spare time, often the book you have read



is usually In The Grip of Strange Thoughts: Russian Poetry in a New Era (Of Judaism; 153) (Russian
Edition).
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