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This volume contains a fresh English translation of Josephus apologetic treatise Against Apion, based on the
new textual research conducted by the Munster Josephus project. It also provides the first English
commentary on this treatise, with comprehensive treatment of the historical, literary, and rhetorical features
of Josephus most engaging literary product. Against Apion contains the most important evidence for hostility
to Judeans in antiquity, as Josephus responds to both Egyptian and Hellenistic slurs on the Judean people,
their origins and character. Josephus robust defense of his people, with his striking account of the Judean
constitution ( theocracy ), also constitutes the finest example of Judean apologetics from antiquity. The
commentary will provide a richly-documented resource for the many readers of this treatise those who study
and teach early Judaism, early Christianity, and the cultural politics of antiquity. It also offers the first
postcolonial reading of Josephus, in his attempt to present his Judean tradition under the cultural hegemony
of the Greek intellectual tradition and the political power of Rome."
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From reader reviews:

Marie Michael:

Have you spare time for the day? What do you do when you have far more or little spare time? Yep, you can
choose the suitable activity intended for spend your time. Any person spent their particular spare time to take
a walk, shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open or maybe read a book entitled Flavius Josephus:
Against Apion (Flavius Josephus: Translation and Commentary)? Maybe it is to be best activity for you. You
already know beside you can spend your time with the favorite's book, you can cleverer than before. Do you
agree with it has the opinion or you have different opinion?

Thomas Whitaker:

In this 21st hundred years, people become competitive in each and every way. By being competitive right
now, people have do something to make them survives, being in the middle of the actual crowded place and
notice by simply surrounding. One thing that oftentimes many people have underestimated that for a while is
reading. That's why, by reading a guide your ability to survive improve then having chance to endure than
other is high. For you personally who want to start reading the book, we give you this kind of Flavius
Josephus: Against Apion (Flavius Josephus: Translation and Commentary) book as beginning and daily
reading e-book. Why, because this book is usually more than just a book.

Marisa Reber:

In this era globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will make
professionals understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information
quicker to share. You can find a lot of sources to get information example: internet, newspapers, book, and
soon. You can see that now, a lot of publisher that will print many kinds of book. The particular book that
recommended to you personally is Flavius Josephus: Against Apion (Flavius Josephus: Translation and
Commentary) this e-book consist a lot of the information from the condition of this world now. This specific
book was represented how do the world has grown up. The dialect styles that writer value to explain it is
easy to understand. The particular writer made some analysis when he makes this book. This is why this
book appropriate all of you.

Catherine Graziani:

As a college student exactly feel bored to reading. If their teacher asked them to go to the library or to make
summary for some guide, they are complained. Just very little students that has reading's heart and soul or
real their hobby. They just do what the educator want, like asked to the library. They go to there but nothing
reading really. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring as well as can't see colorful images on
there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important for yourself. As we know that on this age, many
ways to get whatever we wish. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's country. Therefore this Flavius
Josephus: Against Apion (Flavius Josephus: Translation and Commentary) can make you sense more



interested to read.
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